
Behavior and Risk of E.coli  

Abstract

Hypothesis

We hypothesize that with the presence of E.coli in a household, there is 

an increased risk of getting diarrhea 

Models And Methods

Literature Review

Variables and Empirical Results

Conclusions

Graphs
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The objective of this project is to determine the effect of the presence of E. coli 
in the household on the potential for contracting diarrhea. Our group 
constructed three least square regression models, with each consecutive model 
including additional variables. Our findings suggest that a presence of E. coli 
does in fact increase the potential of contracting diarrhea. With an increase in 
E. coli, diarrhea presence increases by .209. Given these findings we believe it is 
imperative that providing awareness regarding the dangers of E.coli and 
methods by which E. coli presence can be managed is an imperative 
component of health improvement initiatives in Nepal.

The results of our study indicates that our initial hypothesis which states the 
presence of E.coli in a household means an increased risk of getting diarrhea is 
supported by the coefficient for the E.coli level which is significant throughout 
all three models. In addition to this, our chi2-value indicates that there is a 
strong correlation and significant in the 99% level, when compared to the chi2-
critical value. The biggest step to avoiding diarrhea would be to do awareness 
programs to teach the people ways to prevent E.coli is the household though 
washing hands, washing utensils, teaching effective water treatment 
techniques and showing the importance of flush toilets. 

In our preliminary research we discovered that E. coli is present in an 
astounding number of people in many developing countries, such as Nepal. In 
an investigative research paper researchers determined that E. coli was present 
in 18% percent of subjects treated in Bangladesh, and an astonishing 33% in 
Mexico. Furthermore, the study continued to elaborate on the detrimental 
health consequences of E. coli. Per, Qadri et. al., 330,000 deaths of children 
under 5 were directly associated with E. coli worldwide. Diarrhea also results in 
a significant economic burden to those who contract it in developing countries. 
In a study conducted by Sarker et. al., in Bangladeshi hospitals the treatment 
costs alone were found to be $110.10, this accounted for 21.41% of annual 
income in poor households . Given these findings it seems paramount to 
determine ways in which E. coli transmission can be eliminated in Nepal. 
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